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Abstract 
The present study investigated the relationship between parental conditional regard, 
perfectionism, subjective well-being and self-esteem, and the role of perfectionism as 
a mediator in the relationship between parental conditional regard and both subjec-
tive well-being and self-esteem. Using a convenience sampling, 500 Turkish univer-
sity students (M age = 20.83 years old, SD age = 2.05) completed questionnaires. The 
results showed positive links between parental conditional regard and perfectionism, 
negative links between parental conditional regard and both subjective well-being 
and self-esteem and negative links between perfectionism and both subjective well- 
being and self-esteem. While perfectionism was a partial mediator between parental 
conditional regard and self-esteem, perfectionism was not a mediator between pa-
rental conditional regard and subjective well-being. 
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1. Introduction 

Parental conditional regard is a form of parental attitude, in which the love, affection, 
and appreciation shown towards children are dependent on whether they fulfill certain 
expected behaviors (Assor, Roth, & Deci, 2004). The concept of unconditional positive 
regard was first described by Rogers (1959), who has suggested that all individuals need 
to receive unconditional positive regard from persons who occupy an important place 
in their lives, especially their parents (Rogers, 1959). Although certain researchers claim 
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that parental conditional regard reinforces in children the behaviors considered as pos-
itive by their parents (Gewirtz & Pelaez-Nogueras, 1991), other researchers have de-
scribed that parental conditional regard can adversely affect the psychology of children 
(Assor et al., 2004; Assor & Roth, 2007; Assor & Tal, 2012). Parental conditional regard 
consists of four dimensions, which are prosocial behavior, sports performance, aca-
demic success, and emotion control; it is possible for parents exhibiting conditional re-
gard in one of these dimensions to not display conditional regard in another dimension 
(Assor & Roth, 2007). 

The definition and dynamics of parental conditional regard can be clarified by relat-
ing it to concepts used in self-determination theory. The self-determination theory de-
scribes that the motivation of individuals is either autonomous (i.e. intrinsic) or con-
trolled (i.e. extrinsic) (Ryan & Deci, 2000). Autonomous motivation is defined as the 
form of motivation in which the behavior of the individual is determined more by per-
sonal beliefs and values than external factors with the individual taking his/her own de-
cisions and having a feeling of choice. In controlled motivation, on the other hand, the 
individual’s behavior is shaped by external pressures with the individual feeling coerced 
to display certain behaviors (Budak, 2000). It has been suggested that parental condi-
tional regard is a control-oriented attitude, and that it might lead to negative behavioral 
outcomes such as controlled motivation, controlled behavior and internalization (Soe-
nens & Vansteenkiste, 2010). 

The negative consequences of parental conditional regard highlighted by previous 
studies include internalization (Shavit-Miller & Assor, 2003), introjected regulation 
(Assor et al., 2005), low subjective well-being, negative feelings towards parents (As-
sor et al., 2004; Roth et al., 2009), low performance in areas that are conditional for 
parental love and affection (Assor & Roth, 2007), low coping skills, fluctuations in the 
level of self-esteem, short-termed satisfaction, feelings of shame after failure (Assor & 
Tal, 2012), low self-esteem, and in engaging in romantic relations (Roth & Assor, 
2003). 

1.1. Subjective Well-Being 

Diener (2000) defined subjective well-being as a form of satisfaction and positive men-
tal health that includes both cognitive and affective components. Three important 
components of subjective well-being are positive effect, negative effect, and life satisfac-
tion. Positive affect includes positive feelings such as trust, interest, hope, excitement, 
pride, joy, and appreciation; while negative affect includes subjective stress and dissa-
tisfaction, which are associated with negative feelings such as anger, hate, guilt, and 
sadness. Life satisfaction is the cognitive component of the subjective well-being, and 
reflects the individual’s own assessment regarding various aspects of his/her life, such 
as work and marriage. On the other hand, Lyubomirsky and Dickerhoof (2006) de-
scribed the concept of subjective well-being as an individual self-assessment that is not 
equivalent to having superior function in all areas, and which is constantly experienced 
at a subliminal level by the individual. 
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Although it is known that peers and friends have an important effect on the subjec-
tive well-being of individuals during adolescence, it is also important to take into ac-
count the attitude of the parents, since adolescence cannot be considered independently 
of childhood (Driscoll et al., 2008). Studies on the subjective well-being of adolescents 
and children have demonstrated that democratic parental attitudes increase the subjec-
tive well-being of children (Park, 2004), while children with parents using punish-
ment-based approaches exhibit lower academic performance and more social problems 
(Fletcher et al., 2008). Such studies have also evaluated the effect of demographic fac-
tors (age, gender, socio-economic level, education level, civil status, etc.) and personal 
characteristics (self-concept, extraversion, internal focus of control, etc.) (Huebner, 
1991). There have also been studies which investigate whether the factors affecting sub-
jective well-being are universal or long-lasting and which analyze the extent to which 
they are dependent on cultural characteristics (Diener & Suh, 2000). With regard to 
parental conditioning, it is expected that the reduction or denial of the affection shown 
by parents when the children fail to achieve expectations will adversely affect subjective 
well-being.  

1.2. Self-Esteem 

Self-esteem is defined as an individual’s general sense of self-worth, as well as the in-
dividual’s belief that he/she is a valuable person (Rosenberg, 1979). Factors that in-
fluence the development of self-esteem include a general feeling of wellness; the abil-
ity to demonstrate one’s skills; personal achievements; being appreciated and ad-
mired within society; being accepted and liked by others; and the acceptance of one’s 
own physical characteristics and traits (Saygın & Arslan, 2009). Individuals with high 
self-esteem have higher self-respect; feel more valuable; do not consider themselves as 
being better or worse than others; are aware of the personal boundaries of others; and 
expect that they will experience personal development over time. On the other hand, 
individuals with low self-esteem are dissatisfied overall with themselves; have low 
self-respect; and generally hold a negative self-image (Mayhew & Lempers, 1998). 
Mead (1934) investigated the effect of integration into social groups on the develop-
ment of self-esteem, and observed that when the persons that an individual considers 
as important appreciate and value him/her in return, the individual will also value 
him/herself. According to Rogers (1959), self-esteem depends on the sense of value 
the individual receives from his/her social environment. For this reason, the healthy 
development of self-esteem among children is associated with the unconditional ac-
ceptance they receive from their environment for who they are. Herz and Gullone 
(1999) described that the attitude and level of support shown by parents have an in-
fluential role in the adaptive or maladaptive behavior demonstrated by children, em-
phasizing that children seeing strong support and acceptance from their family tend 
to display higher self-esteem, as well as greater competence in their activities. Op-
pressive behavior from parents, on the other hand, can cause adolescents to feel in-
competent, unsuccessful, and inadequate.  



E. Mendi, J. Eldeleklioğlu 
 

1279 

High self-esteem has been linked with high academic performance, social adaptation, 
confidence, desire to achieve and optimism; it also known to reinforce the sense of be-
ing liked and valued by others (Taşgit, 2012). Individuals with stronger communication 
skills and greater creativity can assume more active roles in society. Nowadays, it is 
generally suggested that high self-esteem is closely associated with higher life satisfac-
tion (Bean & Northrup, 2009). Low self-esteem, on the other hand, is known to result 
in a higher incidence of emotional and behavioral disorders such as anxiety (Rosenberg, 
1962; Kawash, 1982; Bagana et al., 2011), social isolation (Leary, 1990; Zhao et al., 2012; 
Sarıcam et al., 2012), low life satisfaction (Zhang & Leung, 2002; Bozorgpour & Salimi, 
2012; Kong & You, 2013), suicidality (Franck et al., 2007), aggressiveness (Teng et al., 
2015), cyber bullying (Brewer & Kerslake, 2015), low motivation, susceptibility to anger 
(Waschull & Kernis, 1996; Papps & O’Carroll, 1998), eating disorders (Joiner & Kashu-
beck, 1996; Brechan & Kvalem, 2015), substance dependence (Workman & Beer, 1989), 
depression (Sowislo & Orth, 2013), and criminal tendencies (Trzesniewski et al., 2006).  

1.3. Perfectionism 

Perfectionism mainly originates from individuals’ desire to be loved, accepted, and ap-
proved, as well as their fear of being rejected (Pamir, 2008). Frost et al. (1990) defined 
perfectionism as an approach in which individuals set excessively high and unrealistic 
standards for themselves; assess themselves in an extremely critical manner; and inad-
vertently follow forms of behavior that are ultimately self-defeating. Previous studies 
particularly evaluated the effect of parental factors on the development of perfection-
ism, and suggested that perfectionists are generally individuals raised in environments 
where love and appreciation were conditional (Frost et al., 1990).  

Hamachek (1978) divided perfectionism into two groups as “normal perfectionism” 
and “neurotic perfectionism.” Neurotic perfectionists tend to harbor a constant anxiety 
about meeting/achieving high standards, while normal perfectionists do not display 
such anxious behavior. Researchers suggested that neurotic perfectionism generally 
appears among individuals raised in familial environments where affection and ap-
preciation were conditional (Hamachek, 1978).  

Behaviors exhibited by perfectionists include the need to constantly check and veri-
fy their own actions; the need to repeatedly correct themselves; constant approv-
al-seeking; excessive planning; difficulty in making decisions; procrastination; avoid-
ance; and attempting to change others. Low self-esteem has an important role in these 
behaviors exhibited by perfectionist individuals (Atasoy, 2014). Studies indicate that 
perfectionism has a positive relationship with depression (Hewitt & Flett, 1991; Bieling 
et al., 2003; Argus & Thompson, 2008; Sherry et al., 2014; Cheng et al., 2015), anxiety 
(Kawamura et al., 2001), personality traits (Hewitt, Flett, & Turnbull, 1992; Stoeber et 
al., 2015), and eating disorders (Brouwers & Wiggum, 1993; Shafran & Mansell, 2001; 
Stice, 2002; Jacobi et al., 2004; Bardone-Cone et al., 2007; Egan, Wade, & Shafran, 
2011; Luo et al., 2013). Similarly, unhealthy perfectionism appears to have a negative 
relationship with self-esteem (Ashby & Rice, 2002). Perfectionist individuals tend to 
experience more problems in interpersonal relations, and to display higher levels of 
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anxiety (Slaney & Ashby, 1996). In addition, it has been observed that perfectionism 
has a positive relationship with pessimism and stress levels, and that perfectionists 
generally have lower levels of satisfaction with themselves and their lives (Mitchelson 
& Burns, 1998).  

1.4. Mediating Role of Perfectionism 

Acceptance, approval, support and feelings of belonging occupy a considerably impor-
tant place in interpersonal relations (Pamir, 2008). Parental conditional regard refers to 
the tendency of parents to display affection and appreciation only when children dis-
play certain behaviors (Assor et al., 2004). Such an attitude contributes to the develop-
ment of perfectionism among children due to their need for parental acceptance, and 
the significance they attribute to their parent’s expectations (Pamir, 2008; Frost et al., 
1990). Hoping to receive acceptance and approval from their parents, perfectionist 
children tend to develop a highly critical perspective of themselves, consequently bear-
ing a constant fear of failure, while also feeling an implicit resentment towards their 
parents. Such an attitude among children is associated with a high negative effect, 
which is a sub-dimension of subjective well-being; these children are consequently ex-
pected to have low subjective well-being. Shim et al. (2013) previously determined that 
associating success with the appreciation and judgment of others led to negative emo-
tions about one’s self. Individuals who feel worthless when faced with failure, and who 
are unable to come to terms with their mistakes, are expected to have lower self-esteem 
(Coopersmith, 1981; Rogers, 1951). Assor et al. (2004) determined in their study that 
children who experience parental conditional regard tend to experience considerable 
fluctuations in their self-esteem levels. The realization that their parent does not accept 
them the way they are adversely affects the self-esteem of the child (Assor & Roth, 
2007). As a result, perfectionism is expected to mediate the relationship of parental 
conditional regard with subjective well-being and self-esteem. 

2. Purpose 

In light of the studies demonstrating the relationship between parental conditional 
regard, perfectionism, subjective well-being, and self-esteem, it seems possible that 
parental conditional regard—which has detrimental effects on the psycho-social 
functioning of individuals—may enhance perfectionism, while also reducing subjec-
tive well-being and self-esteem. Aside from this, it seems possible that perfectionism 
may reduce both the subjective well-being and self-esteem of individuals. The main 
purpose of this study was to investigate whether perfectionism plays a mediating role 
in the relationship of parental conditional regard with subjective well-being and 
self-esteem for Turkish university students. In other words, our aim was to determine 
how perfectionism relates to parental conditional regard, subjective well-being, and 
self-esteem. In the mediation model, we first examined whether perfectionism acts as 
a mediator between parental conditional regard and subjective well-being, and then 
evaluated whether it acts as a mediator between parental conditional regard and 
self-esteem. 
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3. Method 
3.1. Participants 

The study participants included 500 students [335 (67%) females, 165 (33%) males] at-
tending the Education Faculty, Engineering Faculty, Economics Faculty, Administrative 
Sciences Faculty, Science and Letters Faculty, and the Foreign Language School of 
Uludağ University. The age of the study participants ranged between 18 and 25 years 
(mean = 20.83, SD = 2.05). In this study, 86 (17.2%) of the students were preparatory 
class students, 168 (33.6%) were first-year students, 100 (20.0%) were second-year stu-
dents, 80 (16%) were third-year students, and 66 (13.2%) were fourth-year students. 
Participants were selected using the convenience sampling method.  

3.2. Instruments 

The Parental Conditional Regard Scale, which was developed by Assor et al. (2004) in 
accordance with the concept of self-determination, assesses the parental conditional 
regard university students experienced during childhood or adolescence. The scale con-
sists of four dimensions, which are prosocial behavior, sports performance, academic 
performance and emotion control. The scale has a total of 24 items, and is based on a 
six-point Likert-type design (1: never; 6: always). Cronbach’s Alpha (α) internal con-
sistency coefficient of the scale was 0.87 for the mother, and 0.83 for the father. The 
scale was adapted to Turkish by Helvacı (2010), with only the “academic performance” 
and “emotion control” dimensions being included in the Turkish version. These two 
dimensions consist of a total of 12 items, with the α coefficient value for parental regard 
being calculated as higher than 0.76 for both dimensions. The lowest total score that 
can be obtained with the scale is 12, while the highest total score is 72. In both dimen-
sions, a higher score is associated with a higher parental conditional regard. In the 
present study, the Cronbach’s alpha coefficient was determined as 0.91 for the “aca-
demic success” dimension, and 0.77 for the “emotion control” dimension.  

The Multidimensional Perfectionism Scale was developed by Frost et al. (1990) to 
assess the level of perfectionism among adolescents. The scale consists of six dimen-
sions, which are personal standards, concerns over mistakes, organization, doubts 
about actions, parental expectations and parental criticism. The scale is based on a 
five-point Likert-type design, with each item receiving a score between 1 and 5 (1: 
strongly disagree; 5: strongly agree). The scale consists of a total of 35 items. The lowest 
total score that can be obtained with the scale is 35, while the highest total score is 175. 
A higher score is associated with higher level of perfectionism. The α coefficient value 
of the original scale is 0.90. The Turkish adaptation of the scale was prepared by Özbay 
and Mısırlı-Taşdemir (2003), and the reliability coefficient of this adapted version was 
calculated as α = 0.83. In the present study, the Cronbach’s alpha coefficient was deter-
mined as 0.87.  

The Adolescent Subjective Well-Being Scale was developed by Eryılmaz (2009) to as-
sess the subjective well-being of adolescents. The Adolescent Subjective Well-Being 
Scale consists of 15 items and 4 dimensions, which are satisfaction with parental rela-
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tions, satisfaction with relations with important persons, life satisfaction, and positive 
emotions. The scale is based on a four-point Likert-type design, with each item receiv-
ing a score between 1 and 4 (1: strongly disagree; 4: strongly agree). The lowest total 
score that can be obtained on the scale is 15, while the highest total score is 60. A higher 
score is associated with a higher level of subjective well-being. The total reliability coef-
ficient (α) of the scale is 0.88. In the present study, the Cronbach’s alpha coefficient was 
determined as0.90.  

The Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale was developed by Rosenberg (1965) to assess the 
self-esteem of adolescents. The scale consists of 63 items and 12 dimensions, which are 
self-respect, continuity of the notion of self-worth, reliance on others, sensitivity to 
criticism, depressive emotions, dreaminess, psychosomatic symptoms, feeling threat-
ened in interpersonal relations, ability to join discussions, parental interest, relations 
with father and psychic isolation. The scale also includes 10 items organized according 
to the Guttman scale format. The Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale is based on a four-point 
Likert-type design, with each item receiving a score between 0 and 3 (0: strongly disag-
ree; 3: strongly agree). The lowest total score that can be obtained on the scale is 0, 
while the highest total score is 30. A higher score is associated with a higher self-esteem. 
The scale was adapted to Turkish by Çuhadaroğlu (1986). The test-retest reliability 
coefficient of the scale was determined as 0.70. In this study, we used the 10-item Ro-
senberg Self-Esteem Scale organized according to the Guttman format, and recalculated 
the Cronbach’s Alpha (α) internal consistency coefficient for the scale. In the present 
study, the Cronbach’s alpha coefficient was determined as 0.87.  

3.3. Procedure and Data Analysis 

The scales were administered by the researchers to the participating students from 
Uludağ University. Prior to the study procedures, all students were informed regarding 
the purpose of the study and the scales. The students were also informed that none of 
the scales have “right” or “wrong” answers, and that their responses will be kept confi-
dential. The Parental Conditional Regard Scale, the Multidimensional Perfectionism 
Scale, the Adolescent Subjective Well-Being Scale, and the Rosenberg Self-Esteem Scale 
were all provided to the students within a single form. Incomplete forms, as well as er-
roneously completed forms, were excluded from the study. Each study participant 
completed the scales within approximately 25 minutes. 

The Pearson correlation coefficient and hierarchical regression analyses were used to 
determine the relationships between the study variables. In this study, we followed the 
recommendations from Baron and Kenny’s (1986) in analyzing with hierarchical re-
gression analyses whether perfectionism mediated the relationship of parental condi-
tional regard with subjective well-being and self-esteem. The independent variable is 
parental conditional regard, the hypothesized mediating variable is perfectionism and 
the dependent variables are subjective well-being and self-esteem. According to these 
researchers’ recommendations, it is first necessary to identify a significant relationship 
between the independent variable and the hypothesized mediating variable. Secondly, it 
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is also necessary to identify a significant relationship between the hypothesized me-
diating variable and the dependent variable. Thirdly, it is necessary to determine a sig-
nificant relationship between the independent variable and the dependent variable. As a 
final condition, when the mediating variable is included in the regression analysis to-
gether with the independent variable, the significance of the regression coefficient in-
dicating the predictive effect of the independent variable on the dependent variable 
must decrease (or disappear entirely), while the mediating variable still continues to 
have a significant effect on the dependent variable.  

4. Results 
4.1. Descriptive Data and Inter-Correlations 

Table 1 shows the means, descriptive statistics, and inter-correlations of the variables 
that were used. When Table 1 is examined, it possible to see that, the correlational 
analysis indicated significant relationships between the study variables. A positive rela-
tionship was identified between the parental conditional regard and perfectionism (r = 
0.42), while a moderate level negative relationship was identified between the parental 
conditional regard and subjective well-being (r = −0.32) and between the parental con-
ditional regard and self-esteem (r = −0.42). All of these relationships had a significance 
level of 0.01. On the other hand, the relationship between perfectionism and subjective 
well-being (r = −0.13) and between perfectionism and self-esteem (r = −0.30) were 
negative. The relationship between self-esteem and subjective well-being was strong 
and positive (r = 0.52). 

According to the correlations shown above, an increase in parental conditional re-
gard was associated with an increase in perfectionism, and a decrease in subjective 
well-being and self-esteem. On the other hand, an increase in perfectionism was asso-
ciated with a decrease in subjective well-being and self-esteem, while an increase in 
subjective well-being was associated with a parallel increase in self-esteem. 

4.2. Testing the Mediating Role of Perfectionism in the Relationship 
between Parental Conditional Regard and Subjective Well-Being 

To test the mediating effects of perfectionism on the relationships between parental 
conditional regard and subjective well-being, we first determined whether parental  
 
Table 1. Descriptive statistics and inter-correlations of the variables. 

Variable 1 2 3 4 Mean SD Skewness Kurtosis 

1) Parental Conditional Regard -    18.88 9.80 1.84 3.43 

2) Perfectionism 0.42** -   102.07 17.12 0.08 0.24 

3) Subjective Well-Being −0.32** −0.13** -  49.3 7.45 −0.91 1.36 

4) Self-Esteem −0.42** −0.30** 0.52** - 21.26 5.31 −0.47 −0.01 

**p < 0.01. 
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conditional regard and perfectionism were positively related (β = 0.42, t = 10.58, p < 
0.01), and then verified whether perfectionism and subjective well-being were nega-
tively related (β = −0.13, t = −3.1, p < 0.01). A hierarchical regression analysis was used 
to test the final steps of the mediation procedure. The results of the hierarchical regres-
sion analysis suggested that parental conditional regard was negatively related with 
subjective well-being. As shown in Table 2, the first stage of the hierarchical regression 
analysis evaluated only the effect of the parental conditional regard on subjective 
well-being, and determined that parental conditional regard accounted for 10% of the 
subjective well-being [F(1, 49) = 58.58, p = 0.00]. As shown in Table 2, when perfec-
tionism was included in the second stage of the hierarchical regression analysis, it was 
observed that it did not have a significant predictive effect for subjective well-being (β = 
0.00, t = 0.00) [R2 = 0.10, ΔR2 = 0.10, F(2, 49) = 29.23, p = 0.00]. This result suggested 
that perfectionism was not the mediator of the relationship between parental condi-
tional regard and subjective well-being. In other words, perfectionism did not have a 
mediating role between parental conditional regard and subjective well-being. 

Figure 1 shows the mediation model between the variables. 

4.3. Testing the Mediating Role of Perfectionism on the Relationship 
between Parental Conditional Regard and Self-Esteem 

It was determined that parental conditional regard and perfectionism were positively  
 
Table 2. Evaluation of the mediating role of perfectionism on the relationship between parental 
conditional regard and subjective well-being. 

Variable B Standard Error Β t F 

Step 1      

Parental Conditional Regard −0.24 0.03 −0.32 −7.65 58.58 

Step 2      

Parental Conditional Regard −0.24 0.03 −0.32 −6.91 
29.23 

Perfectionism 0.00 0.02 0.00 0.00 

 

 
Figure 1. Evaluation of whether perfectionism significantly mediated the association between 
parental conditional regard and subjective well-being. 
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related (β = 0.42, t = 10.58, p < 0.01), while perfectionism and self-esteem were nega-
tively related (β = −0.31, t = −7.18, p < 0.01). 

A hierarchical regression analysis was used to test the last steps of the mediation 
procedure. The results of the hierarchical regression analysis indicated that parental 
conditional regard was negatively related with self-esteem. Baron and Kenny (1986) 
previously described that such a result demonstrates a partial mediation. As shown in 
Table 3, the first stage of the hierarchical analysis evaluated only the effect of the pa-
rental conditional regard on self-esteem, and determined the parental conditional re-
gard accounted for 18% of self-esteem [F(1, 49) = 111.14, p = 0.00]. In addition, when 
parental conditional regard and perfectionism were evaluated together in the regression 
analysis, the significance of the relationship between parental conditional regard and 
self-esteem decreased, while the relationship between parental conditional regard and 
self-esteem remained significant (β = −0.36, t = −8.16) (R2 = 0.18, ΔR2 = 0.18, F(2, 49) 
= 62.53, p = 0.00). It can thus be said that perfectionism partially mediated the rela-
tionship between parental conditional regard and self-esteem. The relevant results are 
shown in Table 3 (β = −0.15, t = −3.40, p < 0.05).  

By using the SPSS macro process (Preacher, Rucker, & Hayes, 2007) indirect effect in 
simple mediation was estimated. This process involves not only normal theoretical ap-
proach such as Baron and Kenny’s approach (Baron & Kenny, 1986) but also boot-
strapping approach to obtain bias-corrected confidence intervals. Bootstrapping in-
cludes drawing repeated data samples with replacement to gain multiple estimates of 
the indirect effect (Preacher & Hayes, 2008). In bootstrapping, significant results are 
found with 95% confidence interval that does not contain zero (Preacher & Hayes, 
2008). In this study, the indirect effect was significant because the bootstrapped 95% 
confidence interval did not contain zero (−0.05, −0.01). 

Figure 2 shows the mediation model between the variables. As indicated by Figure 
2, when only parental conditional regard was regressed, the beta weight on self-esteem 
was −0.42. The beta weight then decreased from −0.42 to −0.36 when perfectionism was 
added into the equation. 

5. Discussion 

The aim of this study was to investigate the relationships between parental conditional  
 
Table 3. Evaluation of the mediating role of perfectionism on the relationship between parental 
conditional regard and self-esteem. 

Variable B Standard Error Β t F 

Step 1      

Parental Conditional Regard −0.23 0.02 −0.42 −10.54 111.14 

Step 2      

Parental Conditional Regard −0.19 0.02 −0.36 −8.16 
62.53 

Perfectionism −0.04 0.01 −0.15 −3.40 
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Figure 2. Evaluation of whether perfectionism significantly mediated the association between 
parental conditional regard and self-esteem. 

 
regard, perfectionism, subjective well-being, and self-esteem, and to evaluate the me-
diating role of perfectionism between parental conditional regard and subjective 
well-being for Turkish university students. To this end, we first used correlation ana-
lyses to examine the relationships between parental conditional regard, perfectionism, 
subjective well-being, and self-esteem. We then employed multiple regression analysis 
to analyze the mediating role of perfectionism on the relationship between parental 
conditional regard and subjective well-being. The results of the study demonstrated 
that the parental conditional regard had a positive relationship with perfectionism, and 
negative relationship with subjective well-being and self-esteem. In addition to this, 
perfectionism was determined to be negatively related with subjective well-being and 
self-esteem. Furthermore, it was determined that perfectionism mediated the relation-
ship between parental conditional regard and self-esteem, but that it lacked a similar 
mediating role between parental conditional regard and subjective well-being. These 
results were quite significant for a number of reasons: The study results not only con-
tributed to increasing the currently available knowledge regarding parental conditional 
regard, but also demonstrated the mediating role played by perfectionism—a point that 
was not observed or addressed in numerous previous studies investigating the negative 
effects of parental conditional regard.  

First of all, the positive relationship observed in this study between parental condi-
tional regard and perfectionism indicated the importance of parental factors in the de-
velopment of perfectionism—a relationship that has been described in other studies as 
well (Frost et al., 1990; Hamachek, 1978; Hewitt & Flett, 1991). Previous studies clearly 
illustrate that, parents with high expectations who are never satisfied with the success of 
their children, and who display appreciation towards their children to the extent their 
expectations are met, contribute to the development of unhealthy perfectionism (Ha-
machek, 1978; Blatt et al., 1995; McCranie & Bass, 1984).  

Secondly, the negative relationship observed in this study between conditional pa-
rental regard and subjective well-being indicated the negative effect of conditional pa-
rental regard on subjective well-being. In this respect, the results of the present study 
were in agreement with the findings of previous studies (Assor et al., 2004; Driscol et 
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al., 2008; Shim et al., 2013). For example, Driscol et al. (2008) reported that when par-
ents increased the support they showed to their children, the children felt more appre-
ciated and accepted, and hence exhibited greater self-confidence and happiness. Simi-
larly, Shim et al. (2013) determined that the tendency of viewing the appreciation and 
judgement of others as a criterion of success/achievement negatively affected the emo-
tions of children. Furthermore, causing children to feel under constant pressure, and 
preventing them from becoming emotionally independent, contributed to the negative 
relationship observed between parental conditional regard and subjective well-being 
(Ryan & Deci, 2000). The negative relationship between parental conditional regard 
and self-esteem observed in the present study was parallel with the findings of Assor et 
al. (2004) study, which illustrated that children experiencing parental conditional were 
aware that their level of worth and appreciation depended on exhibiting certain beha-
viors. This, in turn, led to anxiety and fluctuations in their level of self-esteem, which 
were due to the alternating episodes of brief satisfaction experienced by the children 
following success, and the shame and sense of worthlessness they experienced following 
failure (Assor & Roth, 2007). There are other studies suggesting a negative relationship 
between parental conditional regard and self-esteem (Coopersmith, 1967; Bachman, 
1970; Kernis et al., 2000). For example, Coopersmith’s (1967) study reported that 
children with higher self-esteem generally had families who exhibit warmer attitudes 
and a higher level of acceptance. 

Thirdly, the results of the present study were parallel with the findings of Stoeber and 
Rambow (2007), illustrating a negative relationship between perfectionism and subjec-
tive well-being. Stoeber and Rambow’s study demonstrated that negative reactions 
shown towards adolescents at the slightest mistake they committed or problem they 
faced, as well as the pressure exerted by parents expecting them to be perfect, adversely 
affected their motivation and subjective well-being. In addition to these findings, cer-
tain studies suggest that both healthy and unhealthy perfectionism can lead to negative 
effects in individuals such as increased anxiety, stress, and depression (Bieling et al., 
2004; Lynd-Stevenson & Hearne, 1999). However, a number of previous studies also 
claim that perfectionism among adolescents leads to higher motivation, success, and 
subjective well-being—although these studies fail to describe whether this increased 
motivation is due to a desire for success or the fear of failure. One such study is the one 
performed by Stoeber and Otto (2006), which claims that perfectionism should not be 
viewed as an exclusively unhealthy behavior, and that healthy perfectionists who are 
not worried about mistakes or concerned about the negative opinions of others tend to 
demonstrate good performance. The said study appears to be in contradiction with the 
findings of our study, which showed that perfectionism has a negative relationship with 
subjective well-being. This seeming contradiction might have stemmed from the dif-
ferent characteristics of the study participants, as well as the different aspects of perfec-
tionism that were considered within the scope of the two studies. A negative relation-
ship between perfectionism and self-respect was similarly observed in previous studies 
(Flett et al., 1991; Rice et al., 1998; Gotwals et al., 2012; Ashby et al., 2002). For example, 
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Flett et al. (1991) determined that, in a manner similar to parental conditional regard, 
unrealistic expectations imposed on individuals by others within the frame of socially 
prescribed perfectionism also led to a higher incidence of depression and lower 
self-esteem. 

Fourthly, the results of our study indicated that perfectionism did not play a mediat-
ing role in the relationship between parental conditional regard and subjective well- 
being. Similar findings were also described in studies suggesting a positive relationship 
between perfection and subjective well-being. For example, Stoeber and Otto (2006) 
suggested that perfectionism can have positive effects such as increasing success and 
motivation. Stoeber and Otto also considered self-oriented perfectionism as a positive 
form of perfectionism, and described that it would not have a negative effect on subjec-
tive well-being. Bieling et al. (2004) similarly determined that perfectionism resulted in 
both positive and negative emotions. Adler (1977) described that perfectionism is 
healthy as long as the individual is also able to concurrently develop his/her skills, and 
that it is actually necessary for self-actualization (Greenspon, 2000). Thus, although pa-
rental conditional regard leads to negative emotions among children, it appears that 
this effect is not mediated through perfectionism, since perfectionism can result in a 
range of both negative and positive emotions. 

Finally, it was observed that an increase in parental conditional regard was associated 
with a decrease in self-esteem, and that this effect was partially mediated by perfection-
ism. This observation is in agreement with the findings of previous studies, which de-
scribe that children subject to parental conditional regard tend to experience feelings of 
worthless after failure, and that their self-esteem varies considerably due to the low level 
of acceptance they see from their parents. As a result, these two factors partly lead these 
individuals to become perfectionists (Assor et al., 2004; Flett et al., 1991). Considering 
the importance of family support in the development of self-esteem, it is inevitable that 
parental conditional regard, accompanied by very low acceptance and tolerance by the 
parents, will lead to low self-esteem among children. Within the frame of perfection-
ism, low self-esteem results from the self-imposed notion that the individual should not 
make any mistakes under any circumstances; this notion, in turn, stems from the con-
ditional appreciation and affection which parents display towards their children. The 
mediating role of perfectionism is associated with the overly self-critical attitude child-
ren acquire as a result of the low self-esteem caused by the parental conditional regard.  

Limitations 

The present study had a number of limitations. First of all, the study was performed 
with students from a single university, which limits the generalizability of the study re-
sults. To increase the generalizability of the study results, the relationship of parental 
conditional regard with other variables can be evaluated using different sampling me-
thods. Another limitation of the study was the fact that study data were obtained using 
self-assessment forms. In future studies, parents can also be evaluated together with 
their children, and by using the applicable assessment tools and observational methods. 
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In addition, alternative approaches could be considered and utilized for evaluating pa-
rental conditional regard. Furthermore, parents whose attitude towards their children 
causes low self-esteem can be evaluated with the scope of longitudinal studies, and data 
from different stages of the individuals’ lives can be evaluated. Finally, the parental 
conditional regard of adolescents can be evaluated based on their childhood expe-
riences, allowing other important factors from this period to be included into the rele-
vant analyses. 

6. Conclusion 

In conclusion, we believe that despite its limitations, this study will contribute signifi-
cantly to the existing literature. This study investigated the mediating role of perfec-
tionism on the relationship of parental conditional regard with subjective well-being 
and self-esteem. Therefore, the study determined not only the relationships of these va-
riables with one another, but also the effect of perfectionism on all these relationships. 
In addition to this, by demonstrating the negative effect of parental conditional regard 
on the subjective well-being and self-esteem level of adolescents, the study also showed 
the importance of parental regard and attitude in the psycho-social development of 
both children and adolescents. The study clearly illustrates that when parents show ap-
preciation and affection towards children exclusively when they display particular be-
haviors, they not only fail to play a positively reinforcing role in their children’s devel-
opment, but also cause the children to feel valuable only under certain specific cir-
cumstances (and hence devoid of value or worth in all other circumstances), thereby 
hampering the proper development of their children’s individualism and self-esteem. In 
light of all these findings, we can recommend that parents are informed about such 
negative effects through effective parental attitude seminars organized by psychological 
counselors, and that the parents are taught about the psychological harms of condition-
al parental regard on children psychology. 
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