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Abstract 

Innovative teaching, regardless of the discipline, brings about interest and 
motivation to learners, which eventually leads to learning. Thus, the role of 
educators is to ensure that they continuously innovate their teaching metho-
dologies so that students’ learning is enhanced. This paper presents an inves-
tigation of selected Malaysian polytechnic lecturers’ understanding and per-
ception towards innovation in teaching. Data were collected from 39 lecturers 
from selected polytechnics in Malaysia. Open-ended questions were given 
among the respondents and the data obtained were then analysed. The find-
ings showed that lecturers’ definitions of innovation are varied and because of 
that, they found that it was challenging for them to innovate teaching me-
thodologies. Nevertheless, the lecturers were actually interested in coming out 
with innovative teaching ideas provided that they are guided to begin. Over-
all, the findings of this study are significant in understanding the factors that 
hinder some of the Malaysian polytechnic lecturers in coming out with inno-
vative teaching methodologies, thus, providing insight information for the 
Department of Polytechnic Education in taking proactive efforts to facilitate 
and encourage innovations in teaching among Malaysian polytechnic lectur-
ers.  
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1. Introduction 

Education is a very powerful instrument for social change and transformation 
and innovative teaching practice is the only way to enhance the quality of educa-
tion (Nicolaides, 2012). Hence, academics are required to be innovative as they 
teach new skills as well as to equip students to be able to face the global chal-
lenges of the 21st century (Bawuro, 2018). The life challenges in today’s world 
require varieties of complex alternatives and solutions (Abu Yazid, 2016); thus, 
being innovative is crucial. In order to be innovative, there are a number of traits 
required which include humility, courage, impartiality, open-mindedness, em-
pathy, enthusiasm, judgement and imagination (Hare, 1993; cited in Wickrama-
singhe & Upeksha, 2016).  

In the field of education, teaching methodologies and innovative ideas are 
seen as two sides of a coin. Effective teaching methodologies depend on stu-
dents’ needs and adequacy of the content. While innovative is defined as beha-
viour that can be described as a process in which new ideas are generated, 
created, developed, applied, promoted, realised, and modified by employees to 
benefit role performance (Kheng & Mahmood, 2013; Hammond et al., 2011; 
Thurlings et al., 2015). Zhang Shuguo (2012) pointed out that education must be 
innovative teaching ideas and teaching methods of innovation, reform the tradi-
tional teaching model, and build a new innovation-oriented education in order 
to achieve the objective. 

A teaching method comprises the principles and methods used by teachers to 
enable student learning. These strategies are determined partly on subject matter 
to be taught and partly by the nature of the learner. Some of the innovative 
teaching methods are the use of media or digital content (e.g. Yunus, Salehi, & 
Embi, 2012), Computer-assisted Instruction (CAI) (e.g. Hashim & Yunus, 2010; 
Hashim & Yunus, 2012; Yunus et al., 2010), and other non-traditional instruc-
tional strategies (e.g. Yunus et al., 2011). For a particular teaching method to be 
appropriate and efficient it has to be in relation to the characteristic of the learn-
er and the type of learning it is supposed to bring about. The methods and tools 
used most by teachers included demonstrations, discussions, laboratories, projects, 
contests, using real objects and supervised experience. Apparently, teacher-centred 
teaching methods are obsolete and students prefer learner-centred teaching me-
thods (Wickramasinghe & Upeksha, 2016).  

Many interactive technologies including web-based or Internet-based learning 
and teaching are among the main features of learner-centred teaching. Teacher 
characteristics may also influence the use of selected teaching methods focusing 
on teaching and learning, length of teaching contract, school location, school 
size, academic background and gender (Shinn, 1997). Unfortunately, many lec-
turers have adopted conventional method of teaching and learning (Nicolaides, 
2012). Some teachers are also still abiding to the old-fashioned methods on 
drilling method where students jot down the information into books and just 
focusing on memorizing (Azman et al., 2018). Teaching techniques are outdated 
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and theoretical knowledge is still disseminated through the technique of chalk 
and talk. The obvious problem in conventional approach is when an instructor 
needs to teach a group of students. It is potentially limiting the support from in-
structor to monitor, focus and assess student individually (Osman et al., 2013). 
Based on Cachia et al. (2010), many academics nowadays are not clear how in-
novation and creativity should be defined and how they should be treated in 
learning and assessment. Furthermore, curricula are often overloaded with con-
tent, which reduces the possibilities of creative and innovative learning ap-
proaches in practice.  

Cachia et al. (2010) conducted a project which aimed to provide a better un-
derstanding of how innovation and creativity are framed in the national and re-
gional education objectives and applied in educational practice at primary and 
secondary school level. In comparison to Malaysia, education has experienced a 
reform to achieve Vision 2020 in order to produce individuals who can compete 
in the international arena (Daud et al., 2012). Thus, innovation and creativity are 
clearly highlighted in the Malaysia Education Blueprint 2015-2025 which is to 
facilitate the development of innovation ecosystems in selected strategic areas 
that are critical to the nation’s economic growth. These ecosystems will support 
both university-driven and demand-driven research, development, and com-
mercialisation models, with significant improvements on a wide range of re-
search measures.  

Innovation is required not only in the business process to aid in more efficient 
ways of conducting the business, but also in the teaching and learning method 
(Yahya et al., 2011). At Malaysian polytechnics, innovative teaching methodolo-
gies are also encouraged among the lecturers. This is proven by the requirement 
of the promotion where lecturers are required to have at least two innovations 
(within three years) done in teaching and learning. However, many of the lec-
turers at polytechnic are still struggling in coming out with innovative teaching 
ideas. Lecturers do use different teaching methods but depending on the nature 
of the courses they are teaching, the number of students, and the facilities avail-
able in the classroom. Among the various common methods used by the lectur-
ers are lecture, group discussion, individual presentation and role play.  

Another method is the integration of modern and traditional teaching strategy 
also known as blended learning (Razali et al., 2016). Some of the lecturers also 
opt for interactive technology teaching method including web-based or inter-
net-based learning. Yet, there are still many lecturers who are actually puzzling 
of what innovation should be done in terms of teaching methodologies. In terms 
of innovative thinking, educational institutions are the carrier of innovative 
education (Yu et al., 2014). Cultural environment is also the main factor that af-
fects the process of innovation. Among other factors that influence innovative 
and creative teaching are personal efforts, teaching beliefs, teaching commitment 
and personal knowledge (Hamed, Preece, & Hashim, 2016). Nevertheless, there 
are many other factors that hinder the lecturers from being innovative. Thus, 
this paper aims to investigate selected Malaysian polytechnic lecturers’ under-
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standing and perception of innovation in teaching.  

2. Methodology 

In this study, qualitative research design was employed where data were col-
lected based on convenience sampling. Convenience sampling was used in this 
study as subjects were selected because of their convenient accessibility and 
proximity to the researchers. 39 lecturers of various academic disciplines (Social 
Science, Engineering and IT) from different polytechnics in Malaysia were in-
volved in collecting the data. Open-ended questions were distributed among the 
participants. In the open-ended questions, the lecturers were asked about their 
own definition of innovation and their understanding of the overall idea of in-
novation including the importance and the frequency of innovation that should 
be done by an academician. They were also asked on the challenges that could be 
the factors that hinder them from coming out with innovative teaching ideas. 
Data were then analysed using text analytic software where inductive coding was 
applied.  

3. Results and Discussion 

This section presents the findings of the data obtained from the open-ended 
questions. The findings are divided into two sub-headings related to the lectur-
ers’ understanding of the definition of innovation and their perceptions towards 
the importance of innovation for academics, as well as the frequency of innova-
tion that they believed need to be done. 

3.1. Understanding of “Innovation” 

When asked about their understanding of the definition of innovation, majority 
of the lecturers (27 out of 39) answered that innovation is “creating new prod-
uct” and “creating new approach”. This shows that, for the lecturers, innovation 
has to be something that is totally new invention. However, there are a few of 
them (11 out of 39) who answered that innovation is an “improvement of exist-
ing products”. This means, innovation does not mean inventing new products 
only, but also upgrading existing products/approaches or improving the existing 
products. Out of 39 lecturers, only one lecturer answered “translating any ideas 
to become products that have values”. This shows that the lecturers’ under-
standing of the definition of innovation is rather limited. One element that they 
have overlooked is “values”. In other words, innovation is not just creating 
something new, but also has value(s) and impacts. This is in line with Cachia et 
al. (2010) who stated that many academics nowadays are not clear how innova-
tion and creativity should be defined and how they should be treated in learning 
and assessment.  

From the findings, it could be seen that the lecturers’ understanding of the de-
finition of innovation is varied. This could hinder the lecturers’ effort in im-
planting innovation due to lack of understanding of the definition. Since major-
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ity of them understood that innovation is creating something new, they felt that 
it is impossible for them to come out with a totally fresh and innovative idea in 
teaching methodologies. They have mistakenly confused between “innovation” 
and “invention”. For them, in order to invent, they need a longer duration and 
more members in their team. They also believed that a new invention could not 
be done in a short duration. Based on the definition given by Thurlings et al. 
(2015) (as discussed earlier), innovation is a behaviour that can be described as a 
process in which new ideas are generated, created, developed, applied, pro-
moted, realized, and modified by employees to benefit role performance. There-
fore, innovation can also be defined as modifying an existing idea in order to 
benefit a target group and also impactful.  

3.2. Perceptions towards the Importance of Innovation 

Apart from the definition, the lecturers were also asked regarding the impor-
tance of innovation for lecturers. From the responses given by the lecturers, it 
could be seen that they have positive perceptions towards its importance. They 
believed that there is no limitation to innovation. One of the respondents ans-
wered that innovation is very imperative especially in the field of education. In 
fact, one of the lecturers responded, “It’s very important as education changes 
day by day”. This is also supported by another respondent where she answered, 
“Innovation in teaching and learning is vital in education to prepare a better 
learning environment for the students”. This is in line with Nicolaides (2012) 
that education is a very powerful instrument for social change and transforma-
tion and innovative teaching practice is the only way to enhance the quality of 
education. From the answers given, it could be seen that they have a positive 
perception towards the importance of innovation for the lecturers. When asked 
how frequent the lecturers think an innovation should be done in a year, major-
ity of them (31 out of 39) agreed that it should be done at least once a year.  

3.3. Challenges in Coming Out with Innovative Teaching Ideas 

As far as the challenges are concerned, many of the lecturers mentioned that the 
structure and curricula of the courses that they are teaching limits their chances 
and opportunity to practice innovative teaching methodologies. One of them 
stated, “too many topics to cover”. Cachia et al. (2010) did mention about this 
challenge where curricula are often overloaded with content, which reduces the 
possibilities of creative and innovative learning approaches in practice.  

Apart from that, lecturers also raised issues related to guidance and support 
by the institution. Among the answers given were, “lack of support and guid-
ance” (16 out of 39) and “lack of training related to innovations for teaching and 
learning” (13 out of 39). They believed that they were not given proper guidance 
in coming out with an innovation. This limits their effort where they always felt 
uncertain when coming out with innovative ideas for teaching. It could be seen 
that among the factors that hinder the lecturers from being innovative are the 
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little knowledge that they have related to the process of innovation. In addition, 
it is also the lecturers’ own effort to reflects their teaching methodologies wheth-
er the teaching suits the demands and the needs of the students. This is sup-
ported by Hamed et al. (2016) who mentioned about the factors that influence 
innovative and creative teaching which are personal efforts, teaching beliefs, 
teaching commitment and personal knowledge.  

4. Conclusion and Implications  

Innovative teaching methodologies are vital in meeting the needs of the current 
generation of students in preparing the students for the global challenges of the 
21st century. It is clear that innovative teaching methodologies do provide stu-
dents with greater experience in learning. As a conclusion, the findings of this 
study have significant implications on the following: 

1) There is a need in changing concepts of education at the level of institu-
tions where more methodologies need to be explored; 

2) The lecturers should be given autonomy in creating a free and active aca-
demic environment they believed suitable to the content of the course that they 
are teaching; 

3) Institutions must be proactive in optimizing and managing the innovations 
implemented by the lecturers; 

4) Efforts need to be done in strengthening practical teaching innovation as to 
prepare a platform for lecturers to bring forward the innovative ideas or to share 
in a community of practice. 

Overall, a lot of efforts need to be done and strategized in order to transform 
the method used by the lecturers in delivering their materials. At the same time, 
lecturers need to increase both the effectiveness and efficiency of the innovation 
process. To begin, the lecturers themselves need to be given a clear definition of 
what innovation is. Most importantly, lecturers need to perceive that their insti-
tution is willing to invest the time and money necessary to support innovation 
and implementation.  
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